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Experience learning made easy—and quickly teach yourself how to use PowerPoint 2003, the Microsoft
Office presentation graphics program. With STEP BY STEP, you can take just the lessons you need, or work
from cover to cover. Either way, you drive the instruction—building and practicing the skills you need, just
when you need them!

Master the tools for transforming your ideas into winning presentations●

Use ready-made design templates or create your own look●

Make your point with compelling charts, diagrams, graphics, text, and hyperlinks to Web content●

Keep it dynamic—animate your slides, insert sounds and movies, and create transitions●

Deliver your presentation in person, over the Web, or on CD●

Prepare for the Microsoft Office Specialist exam●

Practice your skills using the files on CD!

Your Microsoft Office Reference Pack on CD includes:

Twenty-five templates straight from the Microsoft Office team●

Microsoft Office System Quick Reference eBook●

Insider’s Guide to Microsoft Office OneNote eBook—describes new notetaking features in Office●

Microsoft Computer Dictionary, Fifth Edition, eBook—10,000+ entries!●

Introducing the Tablet PC eBook●

Complete STEP BY STEP eBook●

A Note Regarding the CD or DVD

The print version of this book ships with a CD or DVD. For those customers purchasing one of the digital
formats in which this book is available, we are pleased to offer the CD/DVD content as a free download via
O'Reilly Media's Digital Distribution services. To download this content, please visit O'Reilly's web site,
search for the title of this book to find its catalog page, and click on the link below the cover image
(Examples, Companion Content, or Practice Files). Note that while we provide as much of the media content
as we are able via free download, we are sometimes limited by licensing restrictions. Please direct any
questions or concerns to booktech@oreilly.com.
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From reader reviews:

Joseph Braddock:

What do you consider book? It is just for students because they're still students or it for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that question above. Every person
has several personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they
don't desire do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Microsoft® Office
PowerPoint® 2003 Step by Step. All type of book are you able to see on many sources. You can look for the
internet sources or other social media.

William Petterson:

What do you about book? It is not important along? Or just adding material when you really need something
to explain what your own problem? How about your time? Or are you busy person? If you don't have spare
time to accomplish others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And you have spare time?
What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. They have to answer that question due to the
fact just their can do that. It said that about publication. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is right.
Because start from on pre-school until university need this particular Microsoft® Office PowerPoint® 2003
Step by Step to read.

Tisha Betancourt:

The book untitled Microsoft® Office PowerPoint® 2003 Step by Step contain a lot of information on it. The
writer explains your ex idea with easy way. The language is very clear and understandable all the people, so
do definitely not worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book was compiled by famous author. The author
will bring you in the new time of literary works. You can actually read this book because you can keep
reading your smart phone, or gadget, so you can read the book with anywhere and anytime. In a situation you
wish to purchase the e-book, you can open up their official web-site and also order it. Have a nice study.

Keely Charles:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got college students? We believe that that
query was given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. And also
you know that little person like reading or as studying become their hobby. You must know that reading is
very important and book as to be the point. Book is important thing to incorporate you knowledge, except
your teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update with regards to something by book. Amount
types of books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them is Microsoft® Office PowerPoint®
2003 Step by Step.
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