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This book features a great collection of traditional Christmas songs that you can play without reading music!
It includes easy tunes such as "Jolly Old St. Nicholas", "Joy to the World", and "Away in a Manger" as well
as more difficult tunes such as "Winter Wonderland", "White Christmas", and "What Child Is This?". It is
written in a tablature format and builds on the skills learned in "Old-Time Fiddling Book One" and "Old-
Time Fiddling Book Two". The 74-page book features tablature and standard music notation for each tune as
well as accompaniment chords. It also has tips on how to care for the fiddle, how to tune the fiddle, and
photo-illustrated playing technique. The included 43-track CD features all of the tunes in the book and is
split-track so the fiddle part is separate from the piano accompaniment. Each track also features a hi-hat
lead-in. Fiddle tuning tracks are included to help you tune your instrument. This book includes 39 standard
first position Christmas songs. It is suitable for all ages. Included Tunes: Angels from the Realms of Glory;
Angels We Have Heard on High; Away in a Manger; Come, Thou Long-expected Jesus; Deck the Halls;
Frosty the Snowman; Go, Tell It on the Mountain; God Rest Ye Merry Gentlemen; Good King Wenceslas;
Hark! the Herald Angels Sing; Here Comes Santa Claus; I Heard the Bells on Christmas Day; It Came Upon
the Midnight Clear; Jingle Bells; Jolly Old St. Nicholas; Joy to the World; Let It Snow; O Christmas Tree; O
Come, All Ye Faithful; O Come, O Come, Emmanuel; O Holy Night; O Little Town of Bethlehem; Rudolph,
the Red-nosed Reindeer; Santa Claus Is Coming to Town; Silent Night; Silver Bells; The Coventry Carol;
The First Noel; The Holly and the Ivy; The Little Drummer Boy; There's a Song in the Air; No Place Like
Home for the Holidays; Up on the Housetop; We Three Kings of Orient Are; We Wish You a Merry
Christmas; What Child Is This?; While Shepherds Watched Their Flocks; White Christmas; Winter
Wonderland.
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From reader reviews:

Christi Potter:

Here thing why that Old-Time Fiddling Christmas Tunes are different and reputable to be yours. First of all
examining a book is good however it depends in the content than it which is the content is as tasty as food or
not. Old-Time Fiddling Christmas Tunes giving you information deeper including different ways, you can
find any e-book out there but there is no reserve that similar with Old-Time Fiddling Christmas Tunes. It
gives you thrill examining journey, its open up your own personal eyes about the thing this happened in the
world which is probably can be happened around you. You can bring everywhere like in park your car, café,
or even in your means home by train. If you are having difficulties in bringing the published book maybe the
form of Old-Time Fiddling Christmas Tunes in e-book can be your substitute.

Enrique McLean:

The e-book with title Old-Time Fiddling Christmas Tunes has lot of information that you can understand it.
You can get a lot of profit after read this book. This specific book exist new know-how the information that
exist in this reserve represented the condition of the world now. That is important to yo7u to know how the
improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you with new era of the the positive effect. You can
read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read this anywhere you want.

Keith Lugo:

Typically the book Old-Time Fiddling Christmas Tunes has a lot details on it. So when you read this book
you can get a lot of gain. The book was authored by the very famous author. Tom makes some research prior
to write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you can get the point easily after reading this book.

Armando Morris:

A lot of publication has printed but it is unique. You can get it by internet on social media. You can choose
the very best book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is known as
of book Old-Time Fiddling Christmas Tunes. You can contribute your knowledge by it. Without causing the
printed book, it may add your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most critical that, you must
aware about guide. It can bring you from one destination to other place.
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