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This book walks the developer through the process of tailoring their apps in order to appeal to a global
market. Microsoft MVP Chris Miller steps you through the process of enabling multiple language support,
while using a single shared set of language resources using the .NET Framework.  .NET makes it easy to
support multiple languages and cultures.

Starting with a simple mobile application, the author demonstrates how to adapt it for the Android, iOS, and
Windows platforms, showing how to handle the localization with resource files and how to handle
internationalization on each platform.

Readers will learn how to test the application for the localization support and how to avoid common
pitfalls. Using Xamarin.Forms and Visual Studio, the app will be implemented for Android, iOS, and
Windows 10 UWP and 99% of the code will be shared across the platforms.

What You Will Learn:

Localization and Internationalization and why they matter●

How multiple languages are supported on each platform●

How cultural differences like dates and currencies are handled●

How to use tools like Microsoft’s Multilingual App Toolkit to manage language resources●

How to create an localized, cross-platform app with Android Studio, Xcode, Xamarin and Visual Studio●

tools
How to get help translating the text from the application●

Who This Book Is For:

Mobile app developers currently writing native apps for Windows Phone, Android, and iOS.  The Android
and iOS native apps will be written using Xamarin and also with the native tool kits, the Windows apps with
the stock Visual Studio tools.
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From reader reviews:

Lucille Wood:

What do you think of book? It is just for students because they are still students or it for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that problem above. Every person
has diverse personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that
they don't wish do that. You must know how great and important the book Cross-platform Localization for
Native Mobile Apps with Xamarin. All type of book could you see on many methods. You can look for the
internet resources or other social media.

Wilma Blue:

This Cross-platform Localization for Native Mobile Apps with Xamarin usually are reliable for you who
want to certainly be a successful person, why. The main reason of this Cross-platform Localization for
Native Mobile Apps with Xamarin can be one of many great books you must have will be giving you more
than just simple looking at food but feed anyone with information that perhaps will shock your preceding
knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can bring it almost everywhere and whenever your conditions at
e-book and printed types. Beside that this Cross-platform Localization for Native Mobile Apps with Xamarin
forcing you to have an enormous of experience for example rich vocabulary, giving you trial of critical
thinking that we all know it useful in your day pastime. So , let's have it and luxuriate in reading.

Joseph Singleton:

The guide with title Cross-platform Localization for Native Mobile Apps with Xamarin contains a lot of
information that you can find out it. You can get a lot of benefit after read this book. This kind of book exist
new know-how the information that exist in this publication represented the condition of the world at this
point. That is important to yo7u to learn how the improvement of the world. This specific book will bring
you inside new era of the glowbal growth. You can read the e-book in your smart phone, so you can read the
idea anywhere you want.

Dane People:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside having friends, fun activity along with family or
just watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by looking at a book.
Ugh, do you consider reading a book can definitely hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It
all right you can have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Cross-platform
Localization for Native Mobile Apps with Xamarin which is obtaining the e-book version. So , try out this
book? Let's notice.
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