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No part of the United States was more resistant to the civil rights movement and its pursuit of racial equality
than Mississippi. Freedom Is a Constant Struggle explores the civil rights movement in that state to consider
its emergence before the 1965 Voting Rights Act and its impact long after. Did the civil rights movement
have a lasting impact, and, if so, how did it bring about change? Kenneth T. Andrews is the first scholar to
examine not only the history of the movement but its social and political legacy as well. His study
demonstrates how during the 1970s and '80s, local movements worked to shape electoral politics, increase
access to better public schools, and secure the administration of social welfare to needy African Americans.

Freedom Is a Constant Struggle is also the first book of its kind to detail the activities of white supremacists
in Mississippi, revealing how white repression and intimidation sparked black activism and simultaneously
undermined the movement's ability to achieve far-reaching goals. Andrews shows that the federal
government's role was important but reactive as federal actors responded to the sustained struggles between
local movements and their opponents. He tracks the mobilization of black activists by the NAACP, the
creation of Freedom Summer, efforts to galvanize black voters, the momentous desegregation of public
schools and the rise of all-white private academies, and struggles over the economic development of black
communities. From this complex history, Andrews shows how the civil rights movement built innovative
organizations and campaigns that empowered local leadership and had a lasting legacy in Mississippi and
beyond.

Based on an original and creative research design that combines extensive archival research, interviews with
activists, and quantitative historical data, Freedom Is a Constant Struggle provides many new insights into
the civil rights struggle, and it presents a much broader theory to explain whether and how movements have
enduring impacts on politics and society. What results is a work that will be invaluable to students of social
movements, democratic politics, and the struggle for racial freedom in the U.S.
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From reader reviews:

Florence Croy:

Book is definitely written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can know everything you want by a
guide. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important factor to bring us around the world. Close
to that you can your reading skill was fluently. A publication Freedom Is a Constant Struggle: The
Mississippi Civil Rights Movement and Its Legacy will make you to become smarter. You can feel
considerably more confidence if you can know about anything. But some of you think this open or reading a
new book make you bored. It is not make you fun. Why they may be thought like that? Have you trying to
find best book or acceptable book with you?

Ian Hall:

What do you consider book? It is just for students because they are still students or that for all people in the
world, what best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that issue above. Every person has various
personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they don't wish do
that. You must know how great as well as important the book Freedom Is a Constant Struggle: The
Mississippi Civil Rights Movement and Its Legacy. All type of book would you see on many resources. You
can look for the internet sources or other social media.

Donald Lee:

Do you have something that that suits you such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to pick book like
comic, short story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not hoping Freedom Is a Constant Struggle: The
Mississippi Civil Rights Movement and Its Legacy that give your entertainment preference will be satisfied
through reading this book. Reading behavior all over the world can be said as the opportunity for people to
know world better then how they react toward the world. It can't be claimed constantly that reading addiction
only for the geeky man or woman but for all of you who wants to end up being success person. So , for all of
you who want to start looking at as your good habit, you can pick Freedom Is a Constant Struggle: The
Mississippi Civil Rights Movement and Its Legacy become your personal starter.

Walter Burchett:

Would you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Aim to
pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't assess book by its include may doesn't work
this is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in the outside seem
likes. Maybe you answer is usually Freedom Is a Constant Struggle: The Mississippi Civil Rights Movement
and Its Legacy why because the great cover that make you consider about the content will not disappoint an
individual. The inside or content will be fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading 6th sense
will directly guide you to pick up this book.
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