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As information is both the source and the product of all legal work, legal practitioners are crucially
dependent on good access to legal information. The legal databases that are currently available to store and
retrieve statutes, judicial decisions, and legal literature, however, often pose problems to the users with the
effect that they cannot find the information they need.

To a large extent, these problems can be attributed to the limitations of the traditional Boolean query
mechanism used in text databases which is difficult for users to operate. As a possible solution for these
problems, in this book an architecture is proposed for an intelligent interface to legal databases. An
intelligent interface uses knowledge of the task domain of legal practitioners to operate as an intelligent
intermediary between the user and the database.

Interfacing between Lawyers and Computers addresses the most pressing issues that need to be resolved
to allow for the development of advanced user-friendly legal databases. It involves a study into the nature of
legal information-handling and the representation of legal knowledge.

In addition to the theoretical study, it is demonstrated, with the development of a prototype, how the
architecture can be used for the development of practical legal information retrieval systems. The results of
these studies are interpreted to discuss a number of possible applications for the intelligent interface
architecture, including the publication of government information and the organisation of legal information
on the Internet.
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From reader reviews:

Dixie Love:

This Interfacing Between Lawyers and Computers: An Architecture for Knowledge-based Interfaces to
Legal Databases (Law and Electronic Commerce) book is not really ordinary book, you have it then the
world is in your hands. The benefit you will get by reading this book is definitely information inside this
guide incredible fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of information you
will get. This Interfacing Between Lawyers and Computers: An Architecture for Knowledge-based Interfaces
to Legal Databases (Law and Electronic Commerce) without we understand teach the one who reading it
become critical in considering and analyzing. Don't always be worry Interfacing Between Lawyers and
Computers: An Architecture for Knowledge-based Interfaces to Legal Databases (Law and Electronic
Commerce) can bring if you are and not make your case space or bookshelves' become full because you can
have it in the lovely laptop even mobile phone. This Interfacing Between Lawyers and Computers: An
Architecture for Knowledge-based Interfaces to Legal Databases (Law and Electronic Commerce) having
good arrangement in word and layout, so you will not truly feel uninterested in reading.

Nancy Deanda:

The e-book with title Interfacing Between Lawyers and Computers: An Architecture for Knowledge-based
Interfaces to Legal Databases (Law and Electronic Commerce) posesses a lot of information that you can
study it. You can get a lot of advantage after read this book. This kind of book exist new information the
information that exist in this e-book represented the condition of the world right now. That is important to
yo7u to be aware of how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you in new era of the
glowbal growth. You can read the e-book in your smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Robert Delaney:

Typically the book Interfacing Between Lawyers and Computers: An Architecture for Knowledge-based
Interfaces to Legal Databases (Law and Electronic Commerce) has a lot of information on it. So when you
check out this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was authored by the very famous author. Mcdougal
makes some research just before write this book. That book very easy to read you will get the point easily
after looking over this book.

Lisa Phelps:

As a pupil exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library or make
summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's soul or real their
leisure activity. They just do what the professor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to there but
nothing reading really. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring along with can't see
colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important for you. As we know
that on this period, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's



country. Therefore this Interfacing Between Lawyers and Computers: An Architecture for Knowledge-based
Interfaces to Legal Databases (Law and Electronic Commerce) can make you sense more interested to read.
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