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NIST 800-44 v2 Guidelines on Securing Public Web Servers is a set of recommendations from the National
Institute of Standards and Technology. The purpose of the Guidelines on Securing Public Web Servers is to
recommend security practices for designing, implementing, and operating publicly accessible Web servers,
including related network infrastructure issues. Some Federal organizations might need to go beyond these
recommendations or adapt them in other ways to meet their unique requirements. While intended as
recommendations for Federal departments and agencies, it may be used in the private sector on a voluntary
basis. This document may be used by organizations interested in enhancing security on existing and future
Web server systems to reduce the number and frequency of Web-related security incidents. This document
presents generic principles that apply to all systems. This guideline does not cover the following aspects
relating to securing a Web server: Securing other types of network servers Firewalls and routers used to
protect Web servers beyond a basic discussion in Section 8 Security considerations related to Web client
(browser) software Special considerations for high-traffic Web sites with multiple hosts5 Securing back-end
servers that may support the Web server (e.g., database servers, file servers) Disclaimer This hardcopy is not
published by National Institute of Standards and Technology (NIST), the US Government or US Department
of Commerce. The publication of this document should not in any way imply any relationship or affiliation
to the above named organizations and Government.
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From reader reviews:

Enrique Myers:

The ability that you get from NIST SP 800-44 Guidelines on Securing Public Web Servers is the more deep
you excavating the information that hide in the words the more you get thinking about reading it. It doesn't
mean that this book is hard to understand but NIST SP 800-44 Guidelines on Securing Public Web Servers
giving you buzz feeling of reading. The writer conveys their point in a number of way that can be understood
by simply anyone who read this because the author of this publication is well-known enough. This specific
book also makes your current vocabulary increase well. It is therefore easy to understand then can go to you,
both in printed or e-book style are available. We suggest you for having that NIST SP 800-44 Guidelines on
Securing Public Web Servers instantly.

David Barr:

The e-book with title NIST SP 800-44 Guidelines on Securing Public Web Servers has lot of information
that you can learn it. You can get a lot of advantage after read this book. This particular book exist new
understanding the information that exist in this publication represented the condition of the world currently.
That is important to yo7u to be aware of how the improvement of the world. That book will bring you
throughout new era of the syndication. You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read the item
anywhere you want.

Rosalie Cox:

You can find this NIST SP 800-44 Guidelines on Securing Public Web Servers by check out the bookstore or
Mall. Only viewing or reviewing it might to be your solve issue if you get difficulties for the knowledge.
Kinds of this e-book are various. Not only by means of written or printed but also can you enjoy this book by
means of e-book. In the modern era such as now, you just looking because of your mobile phone and
searching what your problem. Right now, choose your current ways to get more information about your
guide. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still revise. Let's try to
choose appropriate ways for you.

Teresa Randall:

As a scholar exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library or to
make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's heart and soul or
real their hobby. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to the library. They go to right now there but
nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring in addition to can't see
colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important for you personally. As we know
that on this age, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country.
So , this NIST SP 800-44 Guidelines on Securing Public Web Servers can make you experience more
interested to read.
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