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For courses in maternal-child nursing, care of women and children, and women’s health, for both 4-year
BSN-level courses and selected ADN-level (2-year) programs

A humanistic, holistic approach to thinking like a nurse
 Olds' Maternal-Newborn Nursing & Women's Health: Across the Lifespan  is a family-focused text that
covers maternal-newborn nursing and women’s health topics with special attention to evidence-based
practice, cultural competence, critical thinking, professionalism, patient education, and home/community
care. Relatable and engaging, the text is built upon the philosophy that pregnancy and birth are normal life
processes, and that family members are partners in care. The holistic approach helps readers develop their
clinical-reasoning skills, and prepare to practice nursing in an ever-changing healthcare environment.

Also available with MyNursingLab®
This title is also available with MyNursingLab—an online homework, tutorial, and assessment program
designed to engage students in the Maternal/Newborn Nursing course and improve results. Its guided
learning path is proven to help students think like a nurse as they move beyond memorization to true
understanding through application.

NOTE: You are purchasing a standalone product; MyNursingLab does not come packaged with this content.
If you would like to purchase both the physical text and MyNursingLab, search the Pearson website.
MyNursingLab should only be purchased when required by an instructor. Students, if interested in
purchasing this title with MyNursingLab, ask your instructor for the correct package ISBN and Course ID.
Instructors, contact your Pearson representative for more information.
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From reader reviews:

Virginia Villalon:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the headline Student
Workbook and Resource Guide for Olds' Maternal-Newborn Nursing & Women's Health Across the
Lifespan suitable to you? The actual book was written by renowned writer in this era. The actual book
untitled Student Workbook and Resource Guide for Olds' Maternal-Newborn Nursing & Women's Health
Across the Lifespanis the one of several books this everyone read now. This kind of book was inspired many
people in the world. When you read this book you will enter the new way of measuring that you ever know
before. The author explained their plan in the simple way, consequently all of people can easily to be aware
of the core of this book. This book will give you a large amount of information about this world now. To
help you see the represented of the world in this particular book.

Maribel Davenport:

Why? Because this Student Workbook and Resource Guide for Olds' Maternal-Newborn Nursing &
Women's Health Across the Lifespan is an unordinary book that the inside of the book waiting for you to
snap the item but latter it will shock you with the secret the item inside. Reading this book close to it was
fantastic author who else write the book in such amazing way makes the content inside easier to understand,
entertaining technique but still convey the meaning fully. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this
ever again or you going to regret it. This book will give you a lot of advantages than the other book get such
as help improving your skill and your critical thinking technique. So , still want to hold off having that book?
If I were you I will go to the publication store hurriedly.

Virginia Hause:

Is it anyone who having spare time then spend it whole day by watching television programs or just lying on
the bed? Do you need something new? This Student Workbook and Resource Guide for Olds' Maternal-
Newborn Nursing & Women's Health Across the Lifespan can be the response, oh how comes? A fresh book
you know. You are so out of date, spending your time by reading in this completely new era is common not a
geek activity. So what these publications have than the others?

Wm Dunlap:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library as well as to
make summary for some publication, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's heart or real
their passion. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to the library. They go to presently there but
nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring along with can't see
colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we know that
on this period, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says, many ways to reach



Chinese's country. Therefore , this Student Workbook and Resource Guide for Olds' Maternal-Newborn
Nursing & Women's Health Across the Lifespan can make you sense more interested to read.
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