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Happy Accidents is a fascinating, entertaining, and highly accessible look at the surprising role serendipity
has played in some of the most important medical discoveries in the twentieth century. What do penicillin,
chemotherapy drugs, X-rays, Valium, the Pap smear, and Viagra have in common? They were each
discovered accidentally, stumbled upon in the search for something else. In the 1990s, Pfizer had high hopes
for a new drug that would boost blood flow to the heart. As they conducted trials on angina sufferers,
researchers noted a startling effect: while the drug did not affect blood flow to the heart, it did affect blood
flow elsewhere! Now over six million American men have taken Viagra in their lifetime.

Winston Churchill once said, “Men occasionally stumble across the truth, but most of them pick themselves
up and hurry off as if nothing has happened.” Within the scientific community, a certain stigma is attached to
chance discovery because it is wrongly seen as pure luck. Happy accidents certainly happen every day, but it
takes intelligence, insight, and creativity to recognize a “Eureka, I found what I wasn't looking for!” moment
and know what to do next. In discussing medical breakthroughs, Dr. Morton Meyers makes a cogent, highly
engaging argument for a more creative, rather than purely linear, approach to science. And it may just save
our lives!
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From reader reviews:

James Miguel:

Often the book Happy Accidents: Serendipity in Major Medical Breakthroughs in the Twentieth Century will
bring one to the new experience of reading a new book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique.
Should you try to find new book to study, this book very suitable to you. The book Happy Accidents:
Serendipity in Major Medical Breakthroughs in the Twentieth Century is much recommended to you to
study. You can also get the e-book from official web site, so you can more easily to read the book.

Tenesha Little:

The guide untitled Happy Accidents: Serendipity in Major Medical Breakthroughs in the Twentieth Century
is the e-book that recommended to you to see. You can see the quality of the book content that will be shown
to an individual. The language that writer use to explained their way of doing something is easily to
understand. The copy writer was did a lot of analysis when write the book, and so the information that they
share to your account is absolutely accurate. You also might get the e-book of Happy Accidents: Serendipity
in Major Medical Breakthroughs in the Twentieth Century from the publisher to make you considerably
more enjoy free time.

Jo Lee:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with good friends is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try point that really
opposite from that. Just one activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you already been ride on and with addition details. Even you love Happy Accidents: Serendipity in
Major Medical Breakthroughs in the Twentieth Century, you may enjoy both. It is great combination right,
you still would like to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh can occur its mind hangout men. What?
Still don't obtain it, oh come on its named reading friends.

Troy Kemp:

This Happy Accidents: Serendipity in Major Medical Breakthroughs in the Twentieth Century is great guide
for you because the content which can be full of information for you who all always deal with world and
have to make decision every minute. That book reveal it facts accurately using great manage word or we can
declare no rambling sentences included. So if you are read this hurriedly you can have whole information in
it. Doesn't mean it only gives you straight forward sentences but tough core information with attractive
delivering sentences. Having Happy Accidents: Serendipity in Major Medical Breakthroughs in the
Twentieth Century in your hand like finding the world in your arm, details in it is not ridiculous one
particular. We can say that no publication that offer you world in ten or fifteen small right but this e-book
already do that. So , it is good reading book. Heya Mr. and Mrs. stressful do you still doubt that?
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