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Introducing the Penny Detective 12

Morris Shannon and his partner Shoddy get involved in some brutal knife murders in this, the 12th Penny
Detective Mystery in the series. The action comes thick and fast on the streets of Liverpool in the 1980s.
This is a must read for lovers of noir and British detective mysteries.

Morris is once again trying to sort of the lies and deceit from the truth in a classic British Detective novel
that is tense, dark, often funny but never dull.

An explosive cocktail that will keep you guessing until the final page.

Warning: This book will not be a life changing experience

Fans of intellectual literature should look away now, or try something more classical. All Penny Detective
books contain no messages, big words, or complicated plots, but they will, hopefully, while away a couple of
hours and entertain. If you are still not convinced; the terrific thing about Amazon is that you can read the
first couple of chapters for free. Believe me; these books don't get any better or worse after that.

John Tallon Jones is to literary intellectuals what John Milton (Paradise Lost) and Leo Tolstoy were, to
having a 'good laugh.' This is disposable fiction at the sharp end, nothing more.

What are people saying about the Penny Detective?

Liverpool Echo

'Take Hercule Poirot, Philip Marlowe, and Inspector Clouseau rolled into one, and you have the Penny
Detective. This is a highly imaginative five-star read.'

Post Online

'The author has made the main character, Morris Shannon, vulnerable and sarcastic and I can relate to this, as
will most readers. The creation of an alcoholic but brilliant sidekick is inspirational, and this alone makes it
different to anything else you will read.'
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From reader reviews:

Kenisha Perkins:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the concept A Simple Case of
Murder: Penny Detective 12 (Volume 12) suitable to you? The book was written by well-known writer in
this era. Typically the book untitled A Simple Case of Murder: Penny Detective 12 (Volume 12)is the one of
several books that will everyone read now. That book was inspired many people in the world. When you
read this reserve you will enter the new dimensions that you ever know prior to. The author explained their
strategy in the simple way, consequently all of people can easily to comprehend the core of this book. This
book will give you a lots of information about this world now. So that you can see the represented of the
world on this book.

Joshua Montgomery:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them family members
or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, or perhaps
playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity here is look different you can read the
book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent all day long to reading a
publication. The book A Simple Case of Murder: Penny Detective 12 (Volume 12) it is extremely good to
read. There are a lot of those who recommended this book. These were enjoying reading this book. Should
you did not have enough space to develop this book you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore simply to read
this book through your smart phone. The price is not very costly but this book provides high quality.

Josephine McIntire:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray a person, why because this A Simple Case of Murder: Penny
Detective 12 (Volume 12) reserve written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make book
that could be understand by anyone who have read the book. Written with good manner for you, dripping
every ideas and writing skill only for eliminate your personal hunger then you still uncertainty A Simple
Case of Murder: Penny Detective 12 (Volume 12) as good book but not only by the cover but also by
content. This is one e-book that can break don't determine book by its protect, so do you still needing a
different sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your reading through sixth sense already told you so
why you have to listening to one more sixth sense.

Kyra Franson:

On this era which is the greater person or who has ability to do something more are more special than other.
Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple method to have that. What you have to do is
just spending your time little but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. One of several books in the top
checklist in your reading list is definitely A Simple Case of Murder: Penny Detective 12 (Volume 12). This
book that is qualified as The Hungry Hills can get you closer in becoming precious person. By looking



upwards and review this book you can get many advantages.
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