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Delight young children and encourage play through unique handmade toys. From sewn and stuffed musical
instruments to interlocking paper building blocks and wooden animal figurines, the projects in this book are
meant to encourage open-ended play. Organized by kid-loving subjects, the toys here follow the themes of
Zoo; House; Blocks, Cars & Trucks; Dress-Up; Music; and Art. Overall, the projects here are meant to
stimulate imagination, build confidence through success and enjoyment, and enhance the bond between
family and friends through the creation of unique, artistic handmade toys and crafts. 

The thirty-five projects in this book include a variety of crafts, from drawing to sewing and light
woodworking. The toys presented here are made out of wonderfully tactile materials—repurposed fabrics,
wood, and paper—and invite opportunities for creative and imaginative play. Every project is easy to
complete, made with accessible materials, and requires little time to make. The projects are simple enough
that endless variation can come from the making of each, leaving enough room for you to make the item to
suit your own personal interests.

With a design aesthetic that is clean, simple, and modern, each project is presented with full-color photos and
hand-drawn instructional illustrations and templates. Projects include:

   • Modern Doll House and Doll House Furniture
   • Portable Zoo Animals
   • Abstract Vertical Puzzle
   • Wooden Nature Scene
   • Bottle-Cap Tambourine
   • Exploration Cape
   • Modern Alphabet Game
   • Shadow Puppet Theater
   • And more!
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From reader reviews:

Angel Echols:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive right now, people
have do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice by
simply surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated the idea for a while is reading.
Yes, by reading a reserve your ability to survive improve then having chance to stand up than other is high.
For you who want to start reading a new book, we give you that Made to Play!: Handmade Toys and Crafts
for Growing Imaginations book as starter and daily reading e-book. Why, because this book is more than just
a book.

Lawrence Weatherby:

The actual book Made to Play!: Handmade Toys and Crafts for Growing Imaginations will bring one to the
new experience of reading the book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. If you try to find
new book you just read, this book very appropriate to you. The book Made to Play!: Handmade Toys and
Crafts for Growing Imaginations is much recommended to you to study. You can also get the e-book in the
official web site, so you can quicker to read the book.

Brandon Inouye:

You can spend your free time to read this book this publication. This Made to Play!: Handmade Toys and
Crafts for Growing Imaginations is simple bringing you can read it in the area, in the beach, train in addition
to soon. If you did not have much space to bring often the printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It
is make you quicker to read it. You can save often the book in your smart phone. And so there are a lot of
benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Lee Villegas:

A lot of e-book has printed but it is different. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the
very best book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is called of book Made
to Play!: Handmade Toys and Crafts for Growing Imaginations. You can contribute your knowledge by it.
Without departing the printed book, it could add your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most
critical that, you must aware about book. It can bring you from one destination for a other place.
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