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So Vast the Prison is the double-threaded story of a modern, educated Algerian woman existing in a man's
society, and, not surprisingly, living a life of contradictions. Djebar, too, tackles cross-cultural issues just by
writing in French of an Arab society (the actual act of writing contrasting with the strong oral traditions of
the indigenous culture), as a woman who has seen revolution in a now post-colonial country, and as an
Algerian living in exile.
In this new novel, Djebar brilliantly plays these contradictions against the bloody history of Carthage, a great
civilization the Berbers were once compared to, and makes it both a tribute to the loss of Berber culture and a
meeting-point of culture and language. As the story of one woman's experience in Algeria, it is a private tale,
but one embedded in a vast history.
A radically singular voice in the world of literature, Assia Djebar's work ultimately reaches beyond the
particulars of Algeria to embrace, in stark yet sensuous language, the universal themes of violence, intimacy,
ostracism, victimization, and exile.
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From reader reviews:

Esmeralda Rossman:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Guide is very important thing for
us to understand everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that book
has different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. They may be
reading whatever they have because their hobby is actually reading a book. How about the person who don't
like looking at a book? Sometime, person feel need book whenever they found difficult problem or even
exercise. Well, probably you should have this So Vast the Prison.

Richard Simpson:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important together with you? Or just adding material when you
really need something to explain what the one you have problem? How about your time? Or are you busy
particular person? If you don't have spare time to accomplish others business, it is make one feel bored
faster. And you have free time? What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. The doctor
has to answer that question due to the fact just their can do that will. It said that about book. Book is familiar
in each person. Yes, it is suitable. Because start from on jardín de infancia until university need this kind of
So Vast the Prison to read.

Verna Riddle:

The publication with title So Vast the Prison includes a lot of information that you can understand it. You
can get a lot of gain after read this book. This book exist new understanding the information that exist in this
guide represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u to learn how the
improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you with new era of the the positive effect. You can
read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you want.

Katherine Khan:

The book untitled So Vast the Prison contain a lot of information on it. The writer explains the woman idea
with easy means. The language is very straightforward all the people, so do not necessarily worry, you can
easy to read it. The book was published by famous author. The author will take you in the new era of literary
works. You can actually read this book because you can please read on your smart phone, or program, so you
can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can available their
official web-site along with order it. Have a nice study.
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