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This passionate and monumental biography reassesses the life and legacy of one of the most significant
cultural figures of the twentieth century

Unevenly respected, easily hated, almost always suspected of being inferior to his reputation, Jean Cocteau
has often been thought of as a jack-of-all-trades, master of none. In this landmark biography, Claude Arnaud
thoroughly contests this characterization, as he celebrates Cocteau’s “fragile genius—a combination almost
unlivable in art” but in his case so fertile.

Arnaud narrates the life of this legendary French novelist, poet, playwright, director, filmmaker, and designer
who, as a young man, pretended to be a sort of a god, but who died as a humble and exhausted craftsman.
His moving and compassionate account examines the nature of Cocteau’s chameleon-like genius, his
romantic attachments, his controversial politics, and his intimate involvement with many of the century’s
leading artistic lights, including Picasso, Proust, Hemingway, Stravinsky, and Tennessee Williams. Already
published to great critical acclaim in France, Arnaud’s penetrating and deeply researched work reveals a
uniquely gifted artist while offering a magnificent cultural history of the twentieth century.
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From reader reviews:

Philip Kirkpatrick:

What do you consider book? It is just for students because they are still students or it for all people in the
world, what best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that problem above. Every person has
different personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they
don't desire do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Jean Cocteau: A Life. All
type of book would you see on many methods. You can look for the internet resources or other social media.

Gerald Magee:

This Jean Cocteau: A Life is fresh way for you who has interest to look for some information as it relief your
hunger of knowledge. Getting deeper you onto it getting knowledge more you know or you who still having
little bit of digest in reading this Jean Cocteau: A Life can be the light food for you personally because the
information inside that book is easy to get by means of anyone. These books build itself in the form that is
certainly reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book contact form. People who think that in publication
form make them feel tired even dizzy this book is the answer. So there isn't any in reading a guide especially
this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for you actually. So , don't miss the idea!
Just read this e-book type for your better life as well as knowledge.

Jodie Jennings:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Jean Cocteau: A Life was colourful and of course
has pictures around. As we know that book Jean Cocteau: A Life has many kinds or style. Start from kids
until youngsters. For example Naruto or Detective Conan you can read and feel that you are the character on
there. So , not at all of book are usually make you bored, any it makes you feel happy, fun and rest. Try to
choose the best book to suit your needs and try to like reading that will.

Gerard Norman:

Some individuals said that they feel weary when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt the item when
they get a half portions of the book. You can choose often the book Jean Cocteau: A Life to make your
reading is interesting. Your skill of reading talent is developing when you like reading. Try to choose basic
book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the opinion about book and studying especially. It is to be initial
opinion for you to like to start a book and learn it. Beside that the reserve Jean Cocteau: A Life can to be
your brand new friend when you're feel alone and confuse in what must you're doing of this time.
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