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How We Cheat Each Other is a textbook on human deceit, as narrated by Odd Nerdrum. It consists of six
short stories in dialogue form, drawing on Nerdrum's experiences in Iceland, Sweden, Norway, Russia and
Germany, and spanning "The Last Days of Immanuel Kant" in the eighteenth century through to our time,
and into the future. The theme of cheating takes various forms: Kant cheats the Dutch painter Haan Van
Meegeren who in turn deceives the world with his forgeries; a German writer is cheated by his country after
the Second World War; the protagonist of "The Diamond Man" is cheated by a spirit; in "The Sleepwalker" a
Swedish painter is continually cheated by his environment; in "Marlowe" a neglected poet cheats the system
that had ignored him for years; and the concluding story, "After Armageddon," ends with an explosion of all
kinds of cheating against a backdrop of torture and slaughter.
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From reader reviews:

Dixie Love:

Within other case, little people like to read book Odd Nerdrum: How We Cheat Each Other: Six Short
Stories by Odd Nerdrum. You can choose the best book if you love reading a book. So long as we know
about how is important any book Odd Nerdrum: How We Cheat Each Other: Six Short Stories by Odd
Nerdrum. You can add knowledge and of course you can around the world with a book. Absolutely right,
due to the fact from book you can learn everything! From your country until eventually foreign or abroad
you will find yourself known. About simple point until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we
are able to open a book or perhaps searching by internet device. It is called e-book. You may use it when you
feel bored to go to the library. Let's examine.

Joshua Allen:

The book Odd Nerdrum: How We Cheat Each Other: Six Short Stories by Odd Nerdrum make you feel
enjoy for your spare time. You can use to make your capable much more increase. Book can to become your
best friend when you getting stress or having big problem together with your subject. If you can make
looking at a book Odd Nerdrum: How We Cheat Each Other: Six Short Stories by Odd Nerdrum to be your
habit, you can get far more advantages, like add your own personal capable, increase your knowledge about
several or all subjects. It is possible to know everything if you like wide open and read a guide Odd
Nerdrum: How We Cheat Each Other: Six Short Stories by Odd Nerdrum. Kinds of book are a lot of. It
means that, science guide or encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you think about this e-book?

William McClanahan:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be update about what going on or data even
knowledge to make them keep up with the era and that is always change and progress. Some of you maybe
will probably update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems
coming to a person is you don't know which one you should start with. This Odd Nerdrum: How We Cheat
Each Other: Six Short Stories by Odd Nerdrum is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the
world. Why, as this book serves what you want and want in this era.

Harry Keller:

The event that you get from Odd Nerdrum: How We Cheat Each Other: Six Short Stories by Odd Nerdrum is
the more deep you digging the information that hide in the words the more you get enthusiastic about reading
it. It does not mean that this book is hard to know but Odd Nerdrum: How We Cheat Each Other: Six Short
Stories by Odd Nerdrum giving you buzz feeling of reading. The author conveys their point in certain way
that can be understood by anyone who read the item because the author of this book is well-known enough.
This kind of book also makes your personal vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to understand then can
go along, both in printed or e-book style are available. We advise you for having that Odd Nerdrum: How



We Cheat Each Other: Six Short Stories by Odd Nerdrum instantly.
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