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An examination of how today's leading philanthropists are revolutionizing the field, using new
methods to have a vastly greater impact on the world.

For philanthropists of the past, charity was often a matter of simply giving money away. For the
philanthrocapitalists – the new generation of billionaires who are reshaping the way they give – it's like
business. Largely trained in the corporate world, these "social investors" are using big-business-style
strategies and expecting results and accountability to match. Bill Gates, the world's richest man, is leading
the way: he has promised his entire fortune to finding a cure for the diseases that kill millions of children in
the poorest countries in the world.

In Philanthrocapitalism, Matthew Bishop and Michael Green examine this new movement and its
implications. Proceeding from interviews with some of the most powerful people on the planet?including
Gates, Bill Clinton, George Soros, Angelina Jolie, and Bono, among others?they show how a web of
wealthy, motivated donors has set out to change the world. Their results will have huge implications: In a
climate resistant to government spending on social causes, their focused donations may be the greatest force
for societal change in our world, and a source of political controversy.
Combining on-the-ground anecdotes, expert analysis, and up-close profiles of the wealthy and powerful, this
is a fascinating look at a small group of people who will change an enormous number of lives.
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From reader reviews:

Bonnie Thorp:

Book is actually written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can learn everything you want by a reserve.
Book has a different type. As we know that book is important matter to bring us around the world. Beside
that you can your reading talent was fluently. A guide Philanthrocapitalism: How the Rich Can Save the
World will make you to end up being smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know about every
thing. But some of you think in which open or reading some sort of book make you bored. It is not
necessarily make you fun. Why they can be thought like that? Have you trying to find best book or ideal
book with you?

Charlotte Neville:

Now a day people that Living in the era just where everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not need people to be aware of each data they get. How individuals to be
smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Reading a book can help
folks out of this uncertainty Information specifically this Philanthrocapitalism: How the Rich Can Save the
World book because book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the info in this book
hundred pct guarantees there is no doubt in it you probably know this.

Bonnie Pace:

The actual book Philanthrocapitalism: How the Rich Can Save the World will bring you to the new
experience of reading a new book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. In case you try to
find new book to learn, this book very ideal to you. The book Philanthrocapitalism: How the Rich Can Save
the World is much recommended to you to study. You can also get the e-book from the official web site, so
you can easier to read the book.

Teresa White:

The e-book with title Philanthrocapitalism: How the Rich Can Save the World has lot of information that you
can learn it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. This particular book exist new understanding the
information that exist in this book represented the condition of the world today. That is important to yo7u to
learn how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you with new era of the glowbal
growth. You can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.
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