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Lust and adventure meet history in this ride through roughshod America that rings truer than any
history book.

Uncovered from the ashes of the British Consulate in Trieste, an archaeological excavation has found the
once-thought destroyed and very private journal of Richard Burton, a man regarded as perhaps one of the
greatest intellects, rogues, and colorful adventurers of the nineteenth century. In the journal’s pages a
different man comes to light: here is Richard Burton unplugged and uncensored—the Renaissance man of his
age fully revealed.

Presented as a transcription of the once-lost journal, Ruffian Dick follows the famous British adventurer into
the true wilderness of American politics and the Wild West, all while the country is on the brink of the Civil
War. Based on the historical fact that Burton actually did visit the United States in 1860, and traveled cross-
country to study and write about the then-notorious polygamous Mormons in their stronghold at Salt Lake
City, Joseph Kennedy’s Doctorow-esque mixture of fact and fiction takes the reader deep into that place and
time.

With Kennedy’s research and eye for historic detail, Ruffian Dick (as Burton was known to his
contemporaries) is an adventure tale that brings to light a side of the famed explorer never seen before.

Skyhorse Publishing, as well as our Arcade, Yucca, and Good Books imprints, are proud to publish a broad
range of books for readers interested in fiction—novels, novellas, political and medical thrillers, comedy,
satire, historical fiction, romance, erotic and love stories, mystery, classic literature, folklore and mythology,
literary classics including Shakespeare, Dumas, Wilde, Cather, and much more. While not every title we
publish becomes a New York Times bestseller or a national bestseller, we are committed to books on subjects
that are sometimes overlooked and to authors whose work might not otherwise find a home.
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From reader reviews:

William Vogt:

The book Ruffian Dick: A Novel of Sir Richard Francis Burton can give more knowledge and information
about everything you want. Why then must we leave the good thing like a book Ruffian Dick: A Novel of Sir
Richard Francis Burton? A few of you have a different opinion about book. But one aim this book can give
many information for us. It is absolutely proper. Right now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge
or information that you take for that, it is possible to give for each other; it is possible to share all of these.
Book Ruffian Dick: A Novel of Sir Richard Francis Burton has simple shape but the truth is know: it has
great and massive function for you. You can seem the enormous world by start and read a book. So it is very
wonderful.

Mildred Perkins:

This Ruffian Dick: A Novel of Sir Richard Francis Burton book is absolutely not ordinary book, you have it
then the world is in your hands. The benefit you have by reading this book is usually information inside this
guide incredible fresh, you will get info which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of information you
will get. That Ruffian Dick: A Novel of Sir Richard Francis Burton without we realize teach the one who
studying it become critical in considering and analyzing. Don't possibly be worry Ruffian Dick: A Novel of
Sir Richard Francis Burton can bring whenever you are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves'
become full because you can have it with your lovely laptop even telephone. This Ruffian Dick: A Novel of
Sir Richard Francis Burton having great arrangement in word along with layout, so you will not feel
uninterested in reading.

Alison Caulfield:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to decide on book
like comic, short story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not attempting Ruffian Dick: A Novel
of Sir Richard Francis Burton that give your fun preference will be satisfied by reading this book. Reading
addiction all over the world can be said as the method for people to know world a great deal better then how
they react in the direction of the world. It can't be said constantly that reading routine only for the geeky
individual but for all of you who wants to always be success person. So , for all you who want to start
studying as your good habit, you could pick Ruffian Dick: A Novel of Sir Richard Francis Burton become
your personal starter.

Nona Smith:

Beside that Ruffian Dick: A Novel of Sir Richard Francis Burton in your phone, it could give you a way to
get closer to the new knowledge or facts. The information and the knowledge you will got here is fresh from
the oven so don't possibly be worry if you feel like an previous people live in narrow village. It is good thing
to have Ruffian Dick: A Novel of Sir Richard Francis Burton because this book offers to you personally



readable information. Do you oftentimes have book but you rarely get what it's interesting features of. Oh
come on, that wil happen if you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable option here cannot be questionable,
including treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to miss that? Find this book in addition to
read it from currently!
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