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By the summer of 1944, the war in Europe had reached a critical point. Both the western Allies and the
Soviets possessed the initiative and forces capable of mounting strategic offensives against the German
enemy. Writing a study of operations on first the Western then Eastern Front, respected military analyst C. J.
Dick offers rare insight into the strengths and weaknesses of generalship on both fronts, especially the
judgments, choices, and compromises made by senior commanders. At the same time, he clarifies the
constraints imposed upon leadership?and upon operations?by doctrinal shortcomings, by logistics, and, not
least, by the nature of coalition war.

From Victory to Stalemate focuses on the Western Front, specifically American, British, and Canadian
operations in France and the Low Countries. Dick's lens throughout is operational art, which links individual
tactical battles to broader strategic aims. Beginning with the D-Day landings in Normandy and the strengths
and weaknesses of the armies, including their military doctrines, Dick goes on to analyze the offensives
launched in the high summer of 1944. He considers the strategic factors and plans that provide the context
for his main concern: the Allied commanders’ handling of army, army group, and theatre offensive
operations.

Dick’s analysis shows us an Allied command limited by thinking that is firmly rooted in the experience of
small wars and the World War I. The resulting incremental approach was further complicated by a
divergence in the ideas and interests of the Allied forces. The man responsible for pulling it all together,
Dwight D. Eisenhower, proved remarkably capable in his role as statesman; he was to be less effective as a
military technician who could govern such difficult subordinates as Bradley and Montgomery. As a result,
the Allied offensive faltered and became a war of attrition, in contrast to the Soviet effort on the Eastern
Front.
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From reader reviews:

Gary McIntosh:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information currently can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a expertise or any news even an issue. What people must be consider
any time those information which is in the former life are challenging to be find than now could be taking
seriously which one is suitable to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you have the
unstable resource then you obtain it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All of
those possibilities will not happen with you if you take From Victory to Stalemate: The Western Front,
Summer 1944 Decisive and Indecisive Military Operations, Volume 1 (Modern War Studies (Hardcover)) as
the daily resource information.

Mary Brunner:

This book untitled From Victory to Stalemate: The Western Front, Summer 1944 Decisive and Indecisive
Military Operations, Volume 1 (Modern War Studies (Hardcover)) to be one of several books in which best
seller in this year, honestly, that is because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit into it.
You will easily to buy this kind of book in the book retail store or you can order it through online. The
publisher with this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quickly to read this book, as you can read this
book in your Smartphone. So there is no reason for you to past this e-book from your list.

Faye Bolin:

Often the book From Victory to Stalemate: The Western Front, Summer 1944 Decisive and Indecisive
Military Operations, Volume 1 (Modern War Studies (Hardcover)) has a lot associated with on it. So when
you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of advantage. The book was published by the very famous
author. Tom makes some research prior to write this book. This particular book very easy to read you may
get the point easily after reading this book.

Alan Sarno:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray anyone, why because this From Victory to Stalemate: The Western
Front, Summer 1944 Decisive and Indecisive Military Operations, Volume 1 (Modern War Studies
(Hardcover)) e-book written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book that could be
understand by anyone who also read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, dripping every
ideas and composing skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still doubt From Victory to
Stalemate: The Western Front, Summer 1944 Decisive and Indecisive Military Operations, Volume 1
(Modern War Studies (Hardcover)) as good book not simply by the cover but also by content. This is one
publication that can break don't judge book by its protect, so do you still needing one more sixth sense to
pick this!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to another sixth



sense.
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